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 Decision summary 

The Delegated Officer has determined to make amendments to Licence L9099/2017/1.  The 
amendments are administrative in nature therefore they do not alter the risk profile of the 
premises, providing those activities, emissions and receptor as stated in existing approvals 
remain unchanged.   

This Transfer Report documents the amendments made pursuant to section 59 and 59(B) of 
the Environmental Protection Act 1986 (EP Act).  

The decision document for the existing licence will remain on the department’s website for 
future reference and will act as a record of the department’s decision making.  

 Scope of assessment 

2.1 Regulatory framework 

In transferring the licence, the department has considered and given due regard to its 
Regulatory Framework and relevant policy documents which are available at 
https://dwer.wa.gov.au/regulatory-documents. 

2.2 Application summary 

Licence L9099/2017/1 is currently held by Kundana Gold Pty Ltd for the Carbine/Paradigm 
Project Area (the premises), located at mining tenement M16/548 in Coolgardie Western 
Australia.  

The premises relate to the categories and the assessed production capacity under 
Schedule 1 of the Environmental Protection Regulations 1987 (EP Regulations) which 
are defined in existing Licence L9099/2017/1. 

On 30 August 2021, Evolution Mining Limited (the applicant) applied to the department to 
transfer Licence L9099/2017/1 under section 59B of the Environmental Protection Act 1986 
(EP Act). The change to the licence is limited only to updating the licence holder details as 
follows: 

Evolution Mining Limited 

ACN: 084 669 036 

Registered Address: Level 24, 175 Liverpool Street SYDNEY NSW 2000 

 Conclusion 

The Delegated Officer determined that the transfer of the Licence is an administrative 
amendment which does not alter the risk profile of the premises. Following a review of the 
ASIC company details, the Delegated Officer transferred the Licence to Evolution Mining 
Limited. The premises shall continue to operate in accordance with the original Licence 
conditions and regulatory requirements. 

3.1 Summary of amendments 

Table 1 below provides a summary of the proposed amendments and will act as a record of 
implemented changes. All proposed changes have been incorporated into the revised licence 
as part of the amendment process.  

https://dwer.wa.gov.au/regulatory-documents
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Table 1: Summary of licence amendments 

Condition no.  Proposed amendments 

Cover page Change ‘Licence Holder’, ‘ACN, and ‘Registered business address’. 
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