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Application for Licence Amendment  

Part V Division 3 of the Environmental Protection Act 1986 

Licence Number L8336/2009/3 

Licence Holder Mindarie Regional Council 

Registered Office 1700 Marmion Avenue 

TAMALA PARK WA 6030 

ABN 17 015 003 687 

File Number DER2015/001723-1 

Premises 
Mindarie Resource Recovery Facility  

Lot 801 on Plan 57533 Pederick Road 

NEERABUP, WA 6031 

As shown in Schedule 1 of this Licence 

Date of Report 22/01/2022 

Decision Revised licence granted 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Steve Checker 
MANAGER WASTE INDUSTRIES 
 
an officer delegated under section 20 of the Environmental Protection Act 1986 (WA)  

Amendment Report 
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 Decision summary 

The Delegated Officer has determined to make amendments to Licence L8336/2009/3.  The 
amendments are administrative in nature therefore they do not alter the risk profile of the 
Premises, providing that activities, emissions and receptors as stated in existing approvals 
remain unchanged.   

This Amendment Report documents the amendments made pursuant to section 59 and 59(B) 
of the Environmental Protection Act 1986 (EP Act).  The decision report for the Existing Licence 
L8336/2009/3 will remain on the department’s website for future reference and will act as a 
record of the department’s decision making.  

 Scope of assessment 

2.1 Regulatory framework 

In amending the licence, the department has considered and given due regard to its Regulatory 
Framework and relevant policy documents which are available at 
https://dwer.wa.gov.au/regulatory-documents. 

2.2 Amendment summary 

Suez Recycling & Recovery Pty Ltd currently holds Licence L8336/2009/3 for the operation of 
the Mindarie Resource Recovery Facility, which is located at Lot 801 on Plan 57533 Pederick 
Road, NEERABUP, WA 6031 (the Premises). 

This amendment is limited to a transfer of Licence L8336/2009/3 from Suez Recycling & 
Recovery Pty Ltd to Mindarie Regional Council. This transfer was made at the request of 
Mindarie Regional Council on 9 November 2021. 

The assessment of the Licence transfer application is limited to a review of land ownership 
details to determine if a licence transfer may occur.  

The Premises relates to the category 67A and the assessed production capacity under Schedule 
1 of the Environmental Protection Regulations 1987 (EP Regulations). There are no proposed 
changes to the current approved Premises categories or design capacity.  

The obligations of the Licence Holder have not changed in the revision of the Licence and the 
transfer is limited to: 

• Registered company name; 

• Occupier registered company address; and 

• DWER File Record Number. 

 Consultation 

The Mindarie Regional Council was provided with the draft Amendment Report on 22 December 
2021 but no comments were received. 

 Conclusion 

Based on the assessment in this Amendment Report, the Delegated Officer has determined 
that an amended licence will be granted, subject to conditions commensurate with the 
determined controls and necessary for administration and reporting requirements. 
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4.1 Summary of amendments 

Table 1 below provides a summary of the proposed amendments and will act as a record of 
implemented changes. All proposed changes have been incorporated into the Revised Licence 
as part of the amendment process.  

Table 1: Summary of Licence amendments 

Characteristic Proposed amendments 

Licence Holder  Updated registered company name  

Registered Address Updated registered address  

DWER File Number Amended to DER2015/001723 
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